
Sale Name: August 2 Auction

LOT 144 - Natural Dog Company Dog Topical Ointment 2 oz 20

Retail Price   20

Condition   Like New

Description

Natural Dog Company Dog Topical Ointment 2 oz 20

Model: BA-SKSR-2S UPC: 638499342662 Brand: Natural Dog Company Title: Natural
Dog Company Dog Topical Ointment 2 oz Condition: Like New $20 Our Skin Soother
Travel Stick is just what the vet ordered. Packed with the same potent, plant-based
punch as our tins and 2 oz sticks, in a convenient chapstick-size for those on-the-go
scrapes, irritations, and frustrations. Skin Soother creates a nourishing barrier to block
contamination and potential infection while healing and soothing the affected area.
With a distraction in tow (we love training treats or maybe their favorite toy) clean up
any excess dirt or debris evident around the affected area. Twist a small amount of
Skin Soother up from the stick and gentle rub a generous amount onto affected area.
Allow the area to dry (a nice belly rub always does the trick!) and follow up with a treat
or play time for a positive reward. Repeat one to three times daily. Consistent &
frequent application to open wounds is crucial to protect against infections & harmful
bacteria. Decrease application as the area improves. Our balm ingredients are organic,
plant-based, and never compromised. Lavender: Anti-inflammatory; helps reduce
itching, swelling, and redness. Chamomile: Antioxidant, anti-inflammatory, and
antimicrobial; helps speed up healing. Frankincense: Natural antiseptic, disinfectant,
and astringent; helps heal boils, infected wounds, and inflammation. Sea Buckthorn
Oil: Loaded with antioxidants, vitamin C, and vitamin E; helps treat burns and wounds.
Myrrh: Anti-fungal, antimicrobial, and astringent; helps fight viral and fungal



infections. Other Ingredients: Cocoa butter, sweet almond oil, coconut oil, safflower
oil, candelilla wax, vetiver, niaouli, benzoin, Vitamin E. We use only the highest quality
ingredients to create a safe, powerful healing treatment a plethora of ailments and
irritations. Powered by plants, this balm heals, soothes, and nourishes even the most
stubborn skin conditions.

Quantity: 1

https://www.quarterpriceauction.com/


